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Who is considered a contact 
of an active case?
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Those living in the same household of an 
individual diagnosed as an active COVID-19 case

Colleagues that have interacted with an active 
COVID-19 case on a daily basis in the workplace 
for a period of more than 15 minutes and have 
been within a distance of less than two meters 
with the active case without wearing a face mask

All who have had direct contact with an active 
COVID-19 case (for example: shaking hands, 
touching anything at the same place, exposure to 
bodily fluids and cough/sneeze droplets)

All who have been in a closed environment with 
an active COVID-19 case (for example: 
classrooms, meeting rooms, hospital waiting 
rooms, etc.)
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A health care worker, or anyone else providing 
direct health care to an active COVID-19 case, or 
laboratory workers who handle COVID-19 
samples without wearing the recommended 
Personal Protective Equipment (PPE), or in case 
of a possible breach in the PPE

Those who have been in an airplane, bus, car, or 
any other mode of transportation, and sitting two 
seats away (in any direction) from an active 
COVID-19 case, including travel companions, 
medical care providers, and the crew or driver 
present

If symptoms are severe or indicate extensive 
exposure, all passengers travelling by that mode 
of transportation with the index case (plane, bus, 
car, etc.) may be considered as close contacts
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